
L010-3930-660-12

LUBRICATION ORDER

30 MARCH1993 L010-3930-660-12

TRUCK, FORKLIFT, 6000 LB.,
VARIABLE REACH, ROUGH TERRAIN

(NSN 3930-01-158-0849)

Reference TM5-3930-660-20 and C9100-1 L

Intervals (on condition or hard time) and the related
man-hour times are based on normal operation.  The
man-hour time specified is the time you need to do all
the services prescribed for a particular interval. On-
condition (OC) oil sample intervals shall be applied
unless changed by the Army Oil Analysis Program
(AOAP) laboratory.  Change the hard time interval if
your lubricants are contaminated or if you are
operating the equipment under adverse operating
conditions, including longer-than-usual operating
hours The hard time interval may be extended during
periods of low activity.  If extended, adequate
preservation precautions must be taken.  Hard time
intervals will be applied in the event AOAP laboratory
support is not available.

Clean fittings before lubricating.  Clean parts with dry
cleaning solvent (SD), type II or equivalent.  Dry

before lubricating.  Dotted arrow points indicate
lubrication on both sides of the equipment.  Level of
maintenance.  The lowest level of maintenance
authorized to lubricate a point is indicated by one of
the following symbols as appropriate:
Operator/Crew(C); and Organizational Maintenance
(0).

REPORTING OF ERRORS
Reporting errors and recommending improvements.
You can help improve this manual.  If you find any
mistakes or if you know of a way to improve the
procedures, please let us know.  Mail your letter or DA
Form 2028 (Recommended Changes to Publications
and Blank forms) direct to: Commander, US Army
Tank-Automotive Command, A IIN: AMSTA-MB,
Warren, Ml 48397-5000.  A reply will be furnished to
you.

TOTAL MAN-HR

INTERVAL MAN-HR
50 1.0
250 1.0
500 2.0
1000 2.0

Approved for public release; distribution is unlimited.
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NOTES

1. LUBRICATION During adverse weather or
abnormal dusty conditions, lubrication may require
daily servicing

2. The lubricating points for the brake pedal and
transmission disconnect pedal counter shaft are
located under the cab (GAA).

3. Lubricate all hinges and door latches with a hand
oiler (OE/HDO).

4. Check the differential oil levels while vehicle is on
a level surface.  Oil should be to the bottom of the
check and fill hole (GO, or GAA, see card 2).

5. Lubricate after fording operations (GAA).

6. WARNING - Do not stand under the attachment
and carriage assembly during lubrication services.
To lube the carriage lube points and tilt cylinder
lower points, raise the fork assembly 48-inches (122
cm) and tilt the carriage assembly forward 90°.  To
lube the tilt cylinder's head pivot pin, place the level
forks/carriage firmly on the ground (GAA).

7. During adverse weather, dusty, or sandy
conditions, change oil and filter element at 250 hour
intervals.  For normal off-highway operation, for
operation under rapid change in ambient
temperature, or for operation in presence of
chemical fumes, change at 375 hour intervals.  Use
MIL-L-2104 hydraulic transmission fluid when
operating the vehicle in temperatures above -10°F (-
23°C), and MIL-L-46167A transmission fluid when
operating in temperatures below -10° F (-23° C).

8. To lube the steering knuckle joint, the vehicle may
have to be moved forward or backwards to align
grease fitting with access hole.  If the fitting is
aligned with the access hole but grease gun will not
go on fitting, turn the wheels right or left until grease
gun fits on grease fitting (GAA).

9. Raise the boom to approximately 150 to lubricate
the boom hoist cylinder pins (GAA).

10. Drain hydraulic reservoir every 2000 hours. Change
hydraulic oil filter and add oil (OE/HDO) to reservoir
until oil is visible in sight gauge. Operate hydraulic
system and check oil level again.
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